

**School Bus Services
(70+passengers)**

COMPANY NAME	SCHOOL BUS SERVICE REGULAR ROUTE - FLAT RATE 2-5 HOURS (1.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLANNED (1.2)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (1.4)
JFK Transportation Co., Inc.	\$525.00	\$78.00	\$0.06
COMPANY NAME	SCHOOL BUS FLAT RATE 2-5 HOURS (2.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLANNED (2.2)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (2.4)
Durham School Services	\$540.90	\$89.25	80 miles @.28/mile (\$22.40)
JFK Transportation Co., Inc.	\$525.00	\$78.00	\$0.06

COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE 6-12 HOURS WITHIN L.A. COUNTY (3.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLANNED (3.2)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF 16 HOURS (3.3)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (3.5)
Durham School Services	\$1,165.65	\$89.25	\$89.25	80 miles @.28/mile (\$22.40)
JFK Transportation Co., Inc.	\$760.00	\$78.00	\$78.00	\$0.06

COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE 6-12 HOURS TO DESTINATIONS WITHIN ORANGE/ VENTURA COUNTIES (3A.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLANNED (3A.2)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF 16 HOURS (3A.3)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (3A.5)
Durham School Services	\$1,165.65	\$89.25	\$89.25	80 miles @.28/mile (\$22.40)
JFK Transportation Co., Inc.	\$760.00	\$78.00	\$78.00	\$0.06

COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE 6-12 HOURS TO DESTINATIONS WITHIN L.A. COUNTY (3B.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLANNED (3B.2)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF 16 HOURS (3B.3)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (3B.5)
Durham School Services	\$1,165.65	\$89.25	\$89.25	80 miles @.28/mile (\$22.40)
JFK Transportation Co., Inc.	\$760.00	\$78.00	\$78.00	\$0.06

Coach Bus Service (47-56 passengers)

COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE UP TO 2 HOURS (7.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLAN (7.2)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (7.4)
Fast Deer Bus Charter, Inc.	\$800.00	\$160.00	15%
H&L Charter Co., Inc.	\$838.00	\$160.00	\$0.20
COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE 2-5 HOURS (8.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLAN (8.2)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (8.4)
Fast Deer Bus Charter, Inc.	\$800.00	\$160.00	15%
H&L Charter Co., Inc.	\$838.00	\$160.00	\$0.20

COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE 6-12 HOURS WITHIN L.A. COUNTY (9.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLAN (9.2)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF 16 HOURS (9.3)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (9.5)
Fast Deer Bus Charter, Inc.	\$1,600.00	\$160.00	No Bid	15%
H&L Charter Co., Inc.	\$1,958.00	\$160.00	\$160.00	\$0.20

COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE 6-12 HOURS TO DESTINATIONS WITHIN ORANGE/ VENTURA COUNTIES (9A.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLAN (9A.2)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF 16 HOURS (9A.3)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (9A.5)
Fast Deer Bus Charter, Inc.	\$800.00	\$160.00	No. Bid	15%
H&L Charter Co., Inc.	\$1,958.00	\$160.00	\$160.00	\$0.20

COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE 6-12 HOURS TO DESTINATIONS WITHIN L.A. COUNTY (9B.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLAN (9B.2)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF 16 HOURS (9B.3)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (9B.5)
Fast Deer Bus Charter, Inc.	\$800.00	\$160.00	No Bid	15%
H&L Charter Co., Inc.	\$1,958.00	\$160.00	\$160.00	\$0.20

Coach Bus Service (28-42 passengers)

COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE UP TO 2 HOURS (4.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLAN (4.2)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (4.4)
Fast Deer Bus Charter, Inc.	\$750.00	\$150.00	15%
H&L Charter Co., Inc.	\$773.00	\$130.00	\$0.20

COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE 2-5 HOURS (5.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLAN (5.2)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (5.4)
Fast Deer Bus Charter, Inc.	\$750.00	\$150.00	15%
H&L Charter Co., Inc.	\$773.00	\$130.00	\$0.20

COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE 6-12 HOURS WITHIN SAN DIEGO COUNTY (6.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLAN (6.2)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF 16 HOURS (6.3)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (6.5)
Fast Deer Bus Charter, Inc.	\$1,500.00	\$150.00	No Bid	15%
H&L Charter Co., Inc.	\$1,683.00	\$130.00	\$130.00	\$0.20

COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE 6-12 HOURS TO DESTINATIONS WITHIN ORANGE/ VENTURA COUNTIES (6A.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLAN (6A.2)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF 16 HOURS (6A.3)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (6A.5)
Fast Deer Bus Charter, Inc.	\$750.00	\$150.00	No Bid	15%
H&L Charter Co., Inc.	\$1,683.00	\$130.00	\$130.00	\$0.20
COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE 6-12 HOURS TO DESTINATIONS WITHIN L.A. COUNTY (6B.1)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF ORIGINAL TRIP PLAN (6B.2)	HOURLY RATE IN EXCESS OF 16 HOURS (6B.3)	FUEL SURCHARGE% (6B.5)
Fast Deer Bus Charter, Inc.	\$750.00	\$150.00	No Bid	15%
H&L Charter Co., Inc.	\$1,683.00	\$130.00	\$130.00	\$0.20

Passenger Van (1-9 passengers)

COMPANY NAME	FLAT RATE UP TO 25 MILES (13.1)	FLAT RATE 25+ MILES (13.2)	<u>WHEELCHAIR</u> FLAT RATE UP TO 25 MILES (13.3)	<u>WHEELCHAIR</u> FLAT RATE 25+ MILES (13.4)
JFK Transportation	\$396.00	\$3.50	No Bid	No Bid